
(4) The board shall adopt rules to administer this part.

Section 102. Section 466.00775, Florida Statutes, is repealed.

Section 103. Subsection (4) of section 514.011, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

514.011 Definitions.—As used in this chapter:

(4) “Public bathing place” means a body of water, natural or modified by
humans, for swimming, diving, and recreational bathing, together with
adjacent shoreline or land area, buildings, equipment, and appurtenances
pertaining thereto, used by consent of the owner or owners and held out to
the public by any person or public body, irrespective of whether a fee is
charged for the use thereof. The bathing water areas of public bathing places
include, but are not limited to, lakes, ponds, rivers, streams, artificial
impoundments, and waters along the coastal and intracoastal beaches and
shores of the state.

Section 104. Section 514.021, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

514.021 Department authorization.—

(1) The department may adopt and enforce rules, which may include
definitions of terms, to protect the health, safety, or welfare of persons by
setting sanitation and safety standards for using public swimming pools and
public bathing places. The department shall review and revise such rules as
necessary, but not less than biennially. Sanitation and safety standards shall
include, but not be limited to, matters relating to structure; appurtenances;
operation; source of water supply; microbiological bacteriological, chemical,
and physical quality of water in the pool or bathing area; method of water
purification, treatment, and disinfection; lifesaving apparatus; and mea-
sures to ensure safety of bathers; and measures to ensure the personal
cleanliness of bathers.

(2) The department may not establish by rule any regulation governing
the design, alteration, modification, or repair of public swimming pools and
bathing places which has no impact on sanitation and safety the health,
safety, and welfare of persons using public swimming pools and bathing
places. Further, the department may not adopt by rule any regulation
governing the construction, erection, or demolition of public swimming pools
and bathing places. It is the intent of the Legislature to preempt those
functions to the Florida Building Commission through adoption and
maintenance of the Florida Building Code. The department shall provide
technical assistance to the commission in updating the construction
standards of the Florida Building Code which govern public swimming
pools and bathing places. Further, the department is authorized to conduct
plan reviews, to issue approvals, and to enforce the special-occupancy
provisions of the Florida Building Code which apply to public swimming
pools and bathing places in conducting any inspections authorized by this

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

76
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



chapter. This subsection does not abrogate the authority of the department to
adopt and enforce appropriate sanitary regulations and requirements as
authorized in subsection (1).

Section 105. Section 514.023, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

514.023 Sampling of beach waters and public bathing places; health
advisories.—

(1) As used in this section, the term “beach waters” means the waters
along the coastal and intracoastal beaches and shores of the state, and
includes salt water and brackish water.

(2) The department may adopt and enforce rules to protect the health,
safety, and welfare of persons using the beach waters and public bathing
places of the state. The rules must establish health standards and prescribe
procedures and timeframes for bacteriological sampling of beach waters and
public bathing places.

(3) The department may issue health advisories if the quality of beach
waters or a public bathing place fails to meet standards established by the
department. The issuance of health advisories related to the results of
bacteriological sampling of beach waters is preempted to the state.

(4) When the department issues a health advisory against swimming in
beach waters or a public bathing place on the basis of finding elevated levels
of fecal coliform, Escherichia coli, or enterococci bacteria in a water sample,
the department shall concurrently notify the municipality or county in which
the affected beach waters are located, whichever has jurisdiction, and the
local office of the Department of Environmental Protection, of the advisory.
The local office of the Department of Environmental Protection shall
promptly investigate wastewater treatment facilities within 1 mile of the
affected beach waters or public bathing place to determine if a facility
experienced an incident that may have contributed to the contamination and
provide the results of the investigation in writing or by electronic means to
the municipality or county, as applicable.

(5) Contingent upon legislative appropriation to the department in the
amount of $600,000 nonrecurring, the department will perform a 3-year
study to determine the water quality at beaches throughout the state. The
study will be performed in all counties that have public-access saltwater and
brackish water beaches.

Section 106. Section 514.025, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

514.025 Assignment of authority to county health departments.—

(1) The department shall assign to county health departments that are
staffed with qualified engineering personnel the functions of reviewing
applications and plans for the construction, development, or modification of
public swimming pools or bathing places; of conducting inspections for and

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

77
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



issuance of initial operating permits; and of issuing all permits. If the county
health department determines that qualified staff are not available is not
assigned the functions of application and plan review and the issuance of
initial operating permits, the department shall be responsible for such
functions. The department shall make the determination concerning the
qualifications of county health department personnel to perform these
functions and may make and enforce such rules pertaining thereto as it
shall deem proper.

(2) After the initial operating permit is issued, the County health
departments are responsible shall assume full responsibility for routine
surveillance of water quality in all public swimming pools and bathing
places, including responsibility for a minimum of two routine inspections
annually, complaint investigations, enforcement procedures, and reissuance
of operating permits, and renewal of operating permits.

(3) The department may assign the responsibilities and functions
specified in this section to any multicounty independent special district
created by the Legislature to perform multiple functions, to include
municipal services and improvements, to the same extent and under the
same conditions as provided in subsections (1) and (2), upon request of the
special district.

Section 107. Section 514.03, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

514.03 Construction plans Approval necessary to construct, develop, or
modify public swimming pools or public bathing places.—It is unlawful for
any person or public body to construct, develop, or modify any public
swimming pool or bathing place, other than coastal or intracoastal beaches,
without a valid construction plans approval from the department. This
section does not preempt the authority of Local governments or local
enforcement districts may determine to conduct plan reviews and inspections
of public swimming pools and bathing places for compliance with the general
construction standards of the Florida Building Code, pursuant to s. 553.80.
Local governments or local enforcement districts may conduct plan reviews
and inspections of public swimming pools and public bathing places for this
purpose.

(1) Any person or public body desiring to construct, develop, or modify
any public swimming pool or bathing place shall file an application for a
construction plans approval with the department on application forms
provided by the department and shall accompany such application with:

(a) Engineering drawings, specifications, descriptions, and detailed maps
of the structure, its appurtenances, and its intended operation.

(b) A description of the source or sources of water supply and amount and
quality of water available and intended to be used.

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

78
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



(c) A description of the method and manner of water purification,
treatment, disinfection, and heating.

(d) Other applicable information deemed necessary by the department to
fulfill the requirements of this chapter.

(2) If the proposed construction of, development of, or modification of a
public swimming pool or bathing place meets standards of public health and
safety as defined in this chapter and rules adopted hereunder, the
department shall grant the application for the construction plans approval
within 30 days after receipt of a complete submittal. If engineering plans
submitted are in substantial compliance with the standards aforementioned,
the department may approve the plans with provisions for corrective action
to be completed prior to issuance of the operating permit.

(3) If the proposed construction, development, or modification of a public
swimming pool or bathing place fails to meet standards of public health and
safety as defined in this chapter and rules adopted hereunder, the
department shall deny the application for construction plans approval
pursuant to the provisions of chapter 120. Such denial shall be issued in
writing within 30 days and shall list the circumstances for denial. Upon
correction of such circumstances, an applicant previously denied permission
to construct, develop, or modify a public swimming pool or bathing place may
reapply for construction plans approval.

(4) An approval of construction plans issued by the department under
this section becomes void 1 year after the date the approval was issued if the
construction is not commenced within 1 year after the date of issuance.

Section 108. Section 514.031, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

514.031 Permit necessary to operate public swimming pool or bathing
place.—

(1) It is unlawful for any person or public body to operate or continue to
operate any public swimming pool or bathing place without a valid permit
from the department, such permit to be obtained in the following manner:

(a) Any person or public body desiring to operate any public swimming
pool or bathing place shall file an application for a permit with the
department, on application forms provided by the department, and shall
accompany such application with:

1. Descriptions of the structure, its appurtenances, and its operation.

1.2. Description of the source or sources of water supply, and the amount
and quality of water available and intended to be used.

2.3. Method and manner of water purification, treatment, disinfection,
and heating.

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

79
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



3.4. Safety equipment and standards to be used.

5. Measures to ensure personal cleanliness of bathers.

4.6. Any other pertinent information deemed necessary by the depart-
ment to fulfill the requirements of this chapter.

(b) If the department determines that the public swimming pool or
bathing place is or may reasonably be expected to be operated in compliance
with this chapter and the rules adopted hereunder, the department shall
grant the application for permit.

(c) If the department determines that the public swimming pool or
bathing place does not meet the provisions outlined in this chapter or the
rules adopted hereunder, the department shall deny the application for a
permit pursuant to the provisions of chapter 120. Such denial shall be in
writing and shall list the circumstances for the denial. Upon correction of
such circumstances, an applicant previously denied permission to operate a
public swimming pool or bathing place may reapply for a permit.

(2) Operating permits shall not be required for coastal or intracoastal
beaches.

(3) Operating permits may be transferred shall not be transferable from
one name or owner to another. When the ownership or name of an existing
public swimming pool or bathing place is changed and such establishment is
operating at the time of the change with a valid permit from the department,
the new owner of the establishment shall apply to the department, upon
forms provided by the department, within 30 days after such a change, for a
reissuance of the existing permit.

(4) Each such operating permit shall be renewed annually and the permit
must be posted in a conspicuous place.

(5) An owner or operator of a public swimming pool, including, but not
limited to, a spa, wading, or special purpose pool, to which admittance is
obtained by membership for a fee shall post in a prominent location within
the facility the most recent pool inspection report issued by the department
pertaining to the health and safety conditions of such facility. The report
shall be legible and readily accessible to members or potential members. The
department shall adopt rules to enforce this subsection. A portable pool may
not be used as a public pool.

Section 109. Section 514.033, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

514.033 Creation of fee schedules authorized.—

(1) The department is authorized to establish a schedule of fees to be
charged by the department or by any authorized county health department
as detailed in s. 514.025 for the review of applications and plans to construct,
develop, or modify a public swimming pool or bathing place, for the issuance

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

80
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



of permits to operate such establishments, and for the review of variance
applications for public swimming pools and bathing places. Fees assessed
under this chapter shall be in an amount sufficient to meet the cost of
carrying out the provisions of this chapter.

(2) The fee schedule shall be: for original construction or development
plan approval, not less than $275 and not more than $500; for modification of
original construction, not less than $100 and not more than $150; for an
initial operating permit, not less than $125 and not more than $250; and for
review of variance applications, not less than $240 and not more than $400.
The department shall assess the minimum fees provided in this subsection
until a fee schedule is promulgated by rule of the department.

(3) Fees shall be Any person or public body operating a public swimming
pool or bathing place shall pay to the department an annual operating permit
fee based on pool or bathing place aggregate gallonage, which shall be: up to
and including 25,000 gallons, not less than $75 and not more than $125; and
in excess of 25,000 gallons, not less than $160 and not more than $265, except
for a pool inspected pursuant to s. 514.0115(2)(b) for which the annual fee
shall be $50.

(4) Fees collected by the department in accordance with this chapter shall
be deposited into the Grants and Donations Trust Fund or Public Swimming
Pool and Bathing Place Trust Fund for the payment of costs incurred in the
administration of this chapter. Fees collected by county health departments
performing functions pursuant to s. 514.025 shall be deposited into the
County Health Department Trust Fund. Any fee collected under this chapter
is nonrefundable.

(5) The department may not charge any fees for services provided under
this chapter other than those fees authorized in this section. However, the
department shall prorate the initial annual fee for an operating permit on a
half-year basis.

Section 110. Subsections (4) and (5) of section 514.05, Florida Statutes,
are amended to read:

514.05 Denial, suspension, or revocation of permit; administrative fines.

(4) All amounts collected pursuant to this section shall be deposited into
the Grants and Donations Trust Fund Public Swimming Pool and Bathing
Place Trust Fund or into the County Health Department Trust Fund,
whichever is applicable.

(5) Under conditions specified by rule, the department may close a public
pool that is not in compliance with this chapter or the rules adopted under
this chapter.

Section 111. Section 514.06, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

81
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



514.06 Injunction to restrain violations.—Any public swimming pool or
public bathing place presenting a significant risk to public health by failing to
meet sanitation and safety standards established pursuant to constructed,
developed, operated, or maintained contrary to the provisions of this chapter
is declared to be a public nuisance, dangerous to health or safety. Such
nuisances may be abated or enjoined in an action brought by the county
health department or the department.

Section 112. Subsections (1) and (2) of section 633.115, Florida Statutes,
are amended to read:

633.115 Fire and Emergency Incident Information Reporting Program;
duties; fire reports.—

(1)(a) The Fire and Emergency Incident Information Reporting Program
is created within the Division of State Fire Marshal. The program shall:

1. Establish and maintain an electronic communication system capable
of transmitting fire and emergency incident information to and between fire
protection agencies.

2. Initiate a Fire and Emergency Incident Information Reporting System
that shall be responsible for:

a. Receiving fire and emergency incident information from fire protection
agencies.

b. Preparing and disseminating annual reports to the Governor, the
President of the Senate, the Speaker of the House of Representatives, fire
protection agencies, and, upon request, the public. Each report shall include,
but not be limited to, the information listed in the National Fire Incident
Reporting System.

c. Upon request, providing other states and federal agencies with fire and
emergency incident data of this state.

3. Adopt rules to effectively and efficiently implement, administer,
manage, maintain, and use the Fire and Emergency Incident Information
Reporting Program. The rules shall be considered minimum requirements
and shall not preclude a fire protection agency from implementing its own
requirements which shall not conflict with the rules of the Division of State
Fire Marshal.

4. By rule, establish procedures and a format for each fire protection
agency to voluntarily monitor its records and submit reports to the program.

5. Establish an electronic information database which is accessible and
searchable by fire protection agencies.

(b) The Division of State Fire Marshal shall consult with the Division of
Forestry of the Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services and the

Ch. 2012-184 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2012-184

82
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.


