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· The Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC) currently recommends 
continuing contact precautions (CP) or 
enhanced barrier precautions (EBP), 
depending on the situation, for the entire 
duration of the patient’s stay in the facility.  

· CDC does not recommend routine 
reassessments for C. auris colonization. 

· Reassessment of colonization may be 
considered in consultation with the Florida 
Department of Health.  

· Reassessment should not be performed for 3 
months after last positive result for C. auris.3  

Evidence suggests that patients remain 
colonized for many months, perhaps 
indefinitely even after acute infection (if 
present) has been treated and resolves.2 
 

When there is no evidence of: 

· Ongoing transmission,  

· Acute diarrhea, or 

· Draining wounds or other sites of secretions/ 
excretions that are unable to be covered or 
contained.5,6  

For ill residents (e.g., dependent on health 
care personnel for health care and activities of 
daily living, ventilator-dependent, etc.) and for 
residents whose infected secretions or 
drainage cannot be contained, use CP or EBP, 
depending on the situation, in addition to 
standard precautions.4 
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·  48 hours after resolution of diarrhea.1,3 

The presence of acute diarrhea due to C. diff 
infections can increase the risk of 
transmission due to health care personnel 
hand contamination.1,3 

Place residents with suspected C. diff and 
more than three (3) diarrheal stools in 
presumptive CP while awaiting test results.1,3 


